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5. National Slate Museum 
6. National Wool Museum 
7. National Waterfront Museum 
8. National Collections Centre – this is not open to the public, but we provide 

access to groups. 
 
We note that, as well as sending an email to our general enquiries contact via our 
website, we have also received the same request at Big Pit National Coal Museum, and 
the National Slate Museum. Our response covers all eight museum sites. 
 
Question 1 - The amount of cash collected per month from January 2001 to December 
2016 (or, otherwise, the latest month available). 
 
Under the relevant financial record keeping legislation1 we are not obliged to retain 
information for more than seven years (the current financial year + six years). That said, 
I am able to provide some information starting from our financial year 01 April 2002 – 31 
March 2003, but not all of it is to the level of detail you have requested. I hope what we 
are able to provide is helpful. 
 
The attached Excel Spreadsheet sets out, over 2 sheets, the following information: 
 

• Total cash donations per annum for all Museums, for the financial year 2002/03 
to 2004/05. 

• Cash donations per month for each Museum, the period 01 April 2005 to 
December 2016. 

 
There are no donation boxes at the National Collections Centre, therefore we have no 
data to provide here and so I am unable to provide you with the information you require. 
 
Question 2 - The list of different currency found in the donation boxes, for the same 
period. 
 
We do not hold this information, therefore I am unable to provide you with the 
information you require. Foreign currency cash is banked in such a way that it does not 
record the individual currencies or their amounts. 
 
In accordance with Section 1.1(a) of the Freedom of information Act 2000, the 
information you seek in relation to the National Collections Centre and the different 
currency, this is not held by Amgueddfa Cymru – National Museum Wales. To the 
extent Amgueddfa Cymru is unable to provide information that fully responds to this part 

 
1 The relevant legislation re. holding financial information for 6 years + current year is: 

• 1970 c.9 Taxes Management Act 1970 
• 1980 c.58 Limitation Act 1980 
• 1994 c.23 Value Added Tax Act 1994 

 



3 
 

of your request, I must therefore provide you with a Refusal Notice under Section 17.1 
of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

Your request was considered according to the principles set out in the National 
Assembly’s Code of Practice on Public Access to Information (third edition). The Code 
is published on the Internet at www.information.wales.gov.uk. 

If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request and 
wish to make a complaint or request a review of our decision, you should write to the 
Director Finance and Corporate Resources at the following address: 
 

Mr. Neil Wicks 
Director of Finance and Corporate Resources 
Amgueddfa Cymru – National Museum Wales 
Cathays Park 
Cardiff CF10 3NP 

 
When dealing with any concerns, we will follow the principles of the National Museum of 
Wales’s Code of Practice on Complaints, which is available on our website at 
https://museum.wales/freedom-of-information/publications-scheme/. 
 
Internal review requests should be submitted within two months of the date of receipt of 
the response to your original letter. 
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) if 
you are not content with the outcome of your complaint or review.  Generally, the ICO 
will not make a decision unless you have exhausted the complaints procedure provided 
by the Museum. 
 
The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: 
 

Information Commissioner's Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire SK9 5AF 

If you have any further queries or concerns then please contact me via my email 
address. 

Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
Elaine Cabuts 
Museum Secretary 



Financial Year Amount in cash donations
2002/03 48,425£ 
2003/04 57,004£ 
2004/05 73,706£ 










